Lo UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES MINDANAO

Bids and Awards Committee for Goods

BAC Resolution No. 05 s. of 2022

DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID AND
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR VARIOUS LOTS OF THE
ASIMOV HAWKS PROJECT EQUIPMENT

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee for Goods
(BAC), posted on the PhilGEPS website, the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place within the
campus for at least seven (7) calendar days the Invitation to Bid for the Asimov HAWKS Project Equipment
consisting of twenty-six (26) lots with a total approved budget for the contract (ABC) in the amount of
P8,017,750.00;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings six (6) bidders submitted their electronic bids upon the deadline for
submission on February 3, 2022;

WHEREAS, after the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements the BAC declared the
following bidders to be eligible for bidding: 1) Jassen Harris Industries Corporation; 2) Philcopy Corporation; 3) Progress
Home and Office Fumishings, and 4) Siccion Marketing. Two bidders were disqualified, namely: 1) PMGL
Refrigeration because their bid was not password-protected, and 2) Techtron Automation since they did not
submit the PhilGEPS Certificate of Platinum Membership and their Mayor’s Permit was valid until December
31, 2021 only;

WHEREAS, upon opening and checking of the financial envelopes submitted by the four (4) eligible bidders,
the following were the bids as read, namely:

Lot Number / Approved Philcopy Jassen Harris Siccion Marketing Progress Home &
Budget for the Contract Corporation Industries Bid Amount Office Furnishings
Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

Lot | /P170,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 2/ P150,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 3 /P130,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 4 / P300,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 5/ P400,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 6 / P127,000.00 126,360.00 No bid No bid No bid

Lot 7/P1,375,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 8 / P330,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 9/P27,500.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 10/ P28,660.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 11/P93,840.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 12/P610,000.00 No bid 610,000.00 No bid No bid

Lot 13 / P450,000.00 No bid No bid 449,500.00 No bid

Lot 14/ P145,000.00 No bid 145,000.00 No bid No bid




Lot Number / Approved Philcopy Jassen Harris Siccion Marketing Progress Home &
Budget for the Contract Corporation Industries Bid Amount Office Furnishings
Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

Lot 15/P1,000,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 16 / P610,600.00 No bid 610,600.00 No bid No bid

Lot 17/ P89,600.00 No bid 89,600.00 No bid No bid

Lot 18 / P499,800.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 19/ P403,900.00 No bid 403,900.00 No bid No bid

Lot 20/ P196,100.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 21/ P410,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 22 / P206,800.00 No bid No bid No bid 205,100.00

Lot 23 / P129,500.00 No bid No bid No bid 129,370.00

Lot 24 / P76,450.00 No bid No bid No bid 64,060.00

Lot 25 / P23,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 26 / P35,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Philcopy
Corporation, the single calculated bid for Lot 6, its bid was found to be compliant and responsive to all the
requirements;

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Jassen
Harris Industries, the single calculated bid for Lots 12, 14, 16, 17 and 19, it was found that its List of Ongoing
Contracts did not include the contracts and notices for the projects listed. However, upon verification by the BAC
through its Secretariat, the BAC found the said documents to be in order; the bids of Jassen Harris Industries for
the aforementioned lots were deemed compliant and responsive to the specifications;

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Siccion
Marketing, the single calculated bid for Lot 13, its bid was found to be compliant and responsive to all the
requirements;

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Progress
Home and Office Furnishings who submitted the single calculated bid for Lots 22, 23 and 24, its bid for each
lot was found to be compliant and responsive to all the requirements for the said lots;

NOW THEREFORE, we the members of the Bids and Awards Committee for Goods hereby RESOLVE to
declare the following bidders as the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid for the lot indicated below and to
recommend them for the award of the contract for the following lots, namely:

Particulars Approved Name of Bidder Bid Amount
Budget

Lot 6 -Laser Colored Printer P127,000.00 Philcopy Corporation 126,360.00
Lot 13- Multispectral/ P450,000.00 Siccion Marketing 449,500.00
Hyperspectral Camera(s)
Lot 12 -UAV Lidar Sensors P610,000.00 Jassen Harris Industries 610,000.00
Lot 14 -3D Printer P145,000.00 Jassen Harris Industries 145,000.00
Lot 16 -UAVs and Accessories P610,600.00 Jassen Harris Industries 610,600.00




Particulars Approved Name of Bidder Bid Amount
Budget

Lot 17 -UAVs and Accessories P89,600.00 Jassen Harris Industries 89.600.00
Lot 19 -UAV Video Cameras P403,900.00 Jassen Harris Industries 403,900.00
Accessories
Lot 22 -Furniture and Fixtures P206,800.00 | Progress Home and Office Furnishings 205,100.00
Lot 23 -Furniture and Fixtures P129,500.00 | Progress Home and Office Furnishings 129,370.00
Lot 24 -Furniture and Fixtures P76,450.00 Progress Home and Office Furnishings 64,060.00
TOTAL P2,833,490.00

RESOLVED through online meeting on February 16, 2022, Davao City, Philippines.

PROF. LEO MANUEL B. ESTANA

PROF. GENE)VIEVE J. QUINTERO

ember

PROF. DOMINICA M. DACERA

Member Vice Chair
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Chair
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Chancellor
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