» INIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES MINDANAO
Bids and Awards Committee for Goods

BAC Resolution No. 06 s. of 2022

DECLARING THE SINGLE CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (SCRB) /LOWEST CALCULATED AND
RESPONSIVE BID (LCRB) AND RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR VARIOUS LOTS OF
THE REBIDDING OF ASIMOV HAWKS PROJECT EQUIPMENT- PBM 2022-01

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee for Goods
(BAC), posted on the PhilGEPS website, the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place within the
campus for at least seven (7) calendar days the Invitation to Bid for the Rebidding of Asimov HAWKS Project

Equipment consisting of cight (8) lots with a total approved budget for the contract (ABC) in the amount of
P5.168.900.00;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings five (5) bidders purchased bid documents and submitted their bids upon
the deadline for submission on March 21, 2022;

WHEREAS, afier the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements the BAC declared all
the five (5) bidders to be eligible for bidding, namely:

1) Wise 82 Tech Builders Inc.: 4) Emcor, Inc. and
2) Jassen Hams Industries Corporation; 5) Air Prosystems.
3) iEquity Technologies Corporation;

WHEREAS, upon opening and checking of the financial envelopes submitted by the five (5) bidders, the
following were the bids as read. namely:

Lot Number / Approved iEquity Emcor AirPro Systems Wise 82 Tech Jassen Harnis
Budget for the Contract Technologies Inc. Builders. Inc. Industrics
Corporation Corporation
Lot 1/ P1,150,000.00 1,147,400.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Lot 2/ P2,410,000.00 2,408,800.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Lot 3 / P330,000,00 No bid 301,800.00 306,656.00 No bid No bid
Lot 4/ P150.000.00 No bid No bid No bid 145,042.24 No bid
Lot 5/ P499.800.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid 499,800.00
Lot 6/ P196.100.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid 196.100.00
Lot 7/ P410.000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid 410,000.00
Lot 8 / P23.000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by iEquity
Technologies Corporation, the single calculated bid for Lots 1 and 2. its bid was found to be compliant and
responsive to all the requirements for these two lots;

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Jassen
Harris Industries Corporation, the single calculated bid for Lots 5. 6 and 7. its bid was found to be compliant
and responsive to all the requirements for these three lots:

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Emcor,
Inc.. the lowest calculated bid for Lot 3 — Air Conditioning Units, its bid was found to be non-compliant for the

reason that the Omnibus Swom Statement (OSS) submitted failed to include the following mandatory provision,
namely:



ix._In case advance nt was made or given, failure to perform or deliver of the obligations and undertakings in

the contract shail be sufficient grounds 1o constitute criminal lability for Swindling (Fstafa) or the commission of fraud
] ] rson or

with unfaithfulness or abuse of confidence through mis iating or converting an

government of the Philippines pursuant to Article 315 of Act No. 3815 5. 1930, as amended, or the Revised Penal Code.
[NEW].

Pursuant to Section 6.4 of GPPB Circular 04-2020, “Non-submission of the Required Forms or nbﬁ-inclusion of
the mandatory provisions in any of the Required forms shall be a ground for disqualification™ of the bidder.

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Wise 82
Tech Builders, Inc., the single calculated bid for Lot 4 - Biometric Lock Assembly, QR-Based Inventory
System and CCTV Kit. its bid was also found to be non-compliant for the reasons stated below. namely:

1) The 1* page of the Price Schedule was not duly signed by the authorized representative;

2) The mandatory provisions to be included in the Bid Form were not included contrary to what was provided
in Sections 6.0 of GPPB Circular 04-2020. Pursuant to the same GPPB circular, the ... non-inclusion of the
mandatory provisions in any of the Required forms shall be a ground for disqualification.”

NOW THEREFORE, we the members of the BAC for Goods hereby RESOLVE the following:

1) To declare iEquity Technologies Corporation as the single calculated and responsive bid (SCRB) and
recommend it for award of the following contracts, namely:
* Lot | with contract amount of P1. 147.400.00 and
* Lot 2 with contract amount of P2.408.800.00:
2) To declare Jassen Harris Industries Corporation as the single calculated and responsive bid (SCRB)
and recommend it for award of the following contracts:
¢ Lot 5 with contract amount of P499 800.00;
¢ Lot 6 with contract amount of P196.100 00 and
* Lot 7 with contract amount of P410,000.00:
3) To direct the Technical Working Group to proceed with the post qualification on the bid submitted by
Air Prosystems. Inc., the next lowest bidder for Lot 3- Air Conditioning Units,
4) To notify the post disqualified bidders: Emcor. Inc and Wise 82 Tech Builders, Inc. of their post-
disqualification and the reason/s for their post-disqualification;
5) To endorse the foregoing for approval by the Chancellor of UP Mindanao.

RESOLVED through online meeting on April 6, 2022, Davao City, Philippines.
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Ms. JO-AN A. GARCIA PROF. GENEVIEVE J. QUINTERO
Member Member
PROF. ERWIN E. PROTACIO PROF. DOMINICA M. DACERA
Member Vice Chair
Approved: W
PROF.%& ANNI E. MURAO

Chancellor §




