University of the Philippines Mindanao
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED BID AND RECOMMENDING
AWARD OF CONTRACT
Resolution No. 23, s. 0f 2017

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC).
published the Invitation to Bid for the bidding of the Supply of Computers, Mobile Tablets, Physics Equipment.
Printers, Projectors, Software, Electronic Devices and Smart TV, with an approved budget of Eleven Million
Five Hundred Ninety Five Thousand Five Hundred Seven and 39/100 pesos only (P11,595,507.39), in the
Manila Bulletin and posted the same in the PhilGEPS website, in the website of UP Mindanao, and in 3
conspicuous place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such publication and postings five{5) bidders purchased bid documents and submitted
their bids on September 25, 2017, the deadline for submission of bids;

WHEREAS, upon opening and preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements of the fiv

bidders all of them were found to be eligible for bidding;

Tt

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial envelope and reading of the bids of the five bidders, the following wer
their bids as read by the BAC, namely:

P11.395,507.59

| Lot Description /
No Approved Budget Emcor AVLS | Gakken Goldman Sciencestar
1 |Desktop Computer 3,602,100.00 No bid[ No bid 3,120,444.00 No bid
P3,832,000.00
2 Workstation Computers 999,600.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid
P1,000,000.00
3 |Mobile Tablet No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
P198,607.39
4 |Physics Equipment No bid No bid No bid No bid 197,500.00
P200,000.00 ;
5 | Projectors 781,100.00 909,057.80| 1,014,666.62 1,257,265.00 No bid |
i P1,125,000.00 ‘
6 |Architecture Laboratory 3,030,000.00 No bid No bid 3,007,500.00 No bid|
P3,033,000.00
7 | Econometrics Laboratory 984,600.00 No bid Nobid|  1,038,006.00 No bid‘
P1,098,000.00 i
8 |Office Application 59,400.00 No bid No bid No bid No bidi
Software '
P74,500.00
9 l Software-Mathlab No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
iP200,000.00
' 10 |SOM IT Equipment and 521,000.00| - No bid No bid 517,873.10 No bid
i Peripherals
'P550,400.00
11 Electronic Devices No bid No bid No bid No bid: No bid
P34,000.00 '
12 Smart TV 245,000.00 No bid, No bid No bid No bid
230.000.00 *
TOTAL ABC



