UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES MINDANAO

Bids and Awards Committee for Goods

BAC Resolution No. 31 s. of 2022

DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR LOTS 1,4, 8 AND 10 OF THE SUPPLY OF
TESTING KITS AND LABORATORY SUPPLIES OF THE GENOMIC BIOSURVEILLANCE OF SARS
COV-2 OF THE PGC MINDANAO (PBM 2022-21)

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee for Goods (BAC),
posted on the PhilGEPS website, on the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place within the campus for at
least seven (7) calendar days the Invitation to Bid of the Supply of Testing Kits and Laboratory Supplies of the Genomic
Biosurveillance of SARS CoV-2 of the PGC Mindanao (PBM 2022-21) with a total approved budget for the contract
(ABC) in the amount of P30,755,300.00 consisting of ten (10) lots;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings nine (9) bidders submitted their bids upon the deadline for submission on October 12, 2022 at

10:00AM;

WHEREAS, after the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical envelope requirements the BAC declared
the following nine (9) bidders to be eligible for bidding, namely: Bio Logix Enterprises Philippines, Microgenetix Inc.,
Golden Bat, RainPhil Inc., Lifeline Diagnostics Supplies Inc., Ads Medical and Laboratory Supplies, Biosite Medical
Instrument, Endure Medical Inc., and Titanium Pharma;

WHEREAS, upon opening and checking of the financial envelopes the following were the bids as read as shown in

the table below, namely:
BIO LOGTX [MICROGEN] GOLDEN | RAINPHIL | LIFELINE | ADS BIOSITE | ENDURE JTITANIU
ENTERPRIS | ETIXINC. | BAT INC.  |DIAGNOSTI| MEDICAL | MEDICAL | MEDICAL | M
ES wnmal| wiz | ez cs AND |INsTRUME] INC. | PHARM
; PHILIPPINE | 9:30AM | @4:59PM | @8:00 AM | SUPPLIES | LABORAT |  NT 10/12/22 A
R S INC. ORY w22 | @sasam | 1n222
/1122 101222 | suppLIES | @8:30AM @9:10A
@8:50 AM @8:05 AM | 101222 M
@8:20 AM
Lot 1: e
Viral RNA Mini Kit Nobid]  Nobid| 3,920,000.00 No bid| 3,402,000.00 No bid}3,318,000.00| Nobid]  Nobid
ABC: P3,920,000.00
Lot 2:
Research Quick
DNA/RNA Viral 723246000  No bidL No bid| Nobid| 736,00000]  Nobid No bid} Nobid|  No bid
MagBead Kit
ABC: P776,000.00
Tot 3: SARS-COV-2 RT-
TSE Aniay Rl Nobid]  Nobid| No bid| No bid| No bid| 3.098,000.00{2,944.000.00] 1,969.440.40]  No bid
Medical Supplics
ABC: P3,200,000.00
Lot 4:
PCR Plates No th No bid| No bid| 2.577,000.00] 5.500.00000]  No bid}4.021.800.00| Nobid] Nobid
ABC:P5,860,000.00
Lot §:
Alcobiol No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid Nobid] Nobid

ABC:P168,500.00

No bidI




Lot 6:

Other Molecular Biology
Consumables
ABC: P400,000.00

No bid}

No bid

No bid}

No bid] No bid

No bid

292,500.00) No bid

No bid

Lot 7:

Common Laboratory

Supplies

ABC:P855,900.00

No bid)

No bid

No bid]

No bidJ No bid

No bid

No bid No bid

No bid

Lot 8;

Filtered Pipette Tips
ABC:P13,840,000.00

13,440,000.00] 4,643,600.00

4,654,972.00] 8,080,000.00{ 7,983,200.00

No bid

9,360,000.00f 5.973,534.00

11,759,80]
0.00

Lot 9:
Tubes

ABC:P1,536,500.00

No bid}

No bid

No bid

718,000.00

No bid

1,498,295.00

1,214,200.00} No bid

No bid

Lot 10:

Racks

ABC:P198,400.00

No bid}

No bid

No bid]

185,000.00]

No bid

No bid

153,560.00

No bid|

No bid

Total

Pi4,163,246.00

P4,643.600,00

PR.574.972.00

P11LS60,000,00

P17,621,200.00

P4,596,205.00

P2LIN060.00]  P7.942974.40

P'11.759.500.
00

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted, the Bids and
Awards Committee passed Resolution 28 Declaring the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid and Recommending
Award of Contract for Lots 2, 3, and 9 on November 16, 2022 with details presented below, namely:

Lot Description Name of Bidder Bid Amount (Php)

Number

Lot 2 Rescarch Quick DNA/RNA  Viral | Lifeline Diagnostics Supplies 736,000.00
MagBead Kit

Lot3 SARS-COV2 RT-PCR Assay Kit and | Endure Medical Inc. 1,969,440.40
Medical Supplics

Lot 9 Tubes RainPhil Inc. 718,000.00

WHEREAS, the TWG proceeded with the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted
by the bidders for the remaining lots as summarized in the table below: '

Lot Description Name of Bidder Bid Amount (Php)
Number

Lot | Viral RNA Mini Kit Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 3,920,000.00
Lot4 PCR Plates RainPhil Inc. 2,577,000.00
Lot 6 Other Molecular Biology Consumables Biosite Medical Instruments 292,500.00
Lot 8 Filtered Pipette Tips Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 4,654,972.00
Lot 10 Racks Biosite Medical Instruments 153,560.00

WHEREAS, after the verification of the bid submitted by Biosite Medical Instruments, the lone bidder for Lot 6 -
Other Molecular Biology Consumables, it was confirmed that their bid did not cover all the items included in this lot,
thus the BAC, upon the recommendation of the TWG declared the bid of Biosite Medical Instruments to be non-
compliant and non-responsive;

WHEREAS, upon the recommendation of the TWG, the BAC found the following bids to be compliant and
responsive to the technical specifications and recommended them for award of each lot listed hereunder:

Lot Number Description Name of Bidder
Lot 1 Viral RNA Mini Kit Golden Bat (Far East) Inc.
Lot 4 PCR Plates RainPhil Inc.




Lot 8 Filtered Pipette Tips Golden Bat (Far East) Inc.
Lot 10 Racks Biosite Medical Instruments

NOW THEREFORE, we the members of the Bids and Awards Committee for Goods hereby RESOLVE
the following:

1) To declare the following bidders as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB) for the lots so
indicated and recommend them for award of the contracts listed below, namely:

Lot Number Description Name of Bidder Amount (Php)
Lot 1 Viral RNA Mini Kit Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 3,920,000.00
Lot 4 PCR Plates RainPhil Inc. 2,577,000.00
Lot 8 Filtered Pipette Tips Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 4,654,972.00
Lot 10 Racks Biosite Medical Instruments 153,560.00

2) To declare a failure of bidding for Lot 6 - Other Molecular Biology Consumables since there are no
qualified bidders;

3) To reiterate the declaration of failed bidding for Lot 5 — Alcohol and Lot 7= Common Laboratory Supplies
made by the BAC per BAC Resolution No 28 on November 16, 2022;

RESOLVED through an online meeting on December 9, 2022, Davao City, Philippines.

PROF. GENE J. QUINTERO
ber

PROF. ERWIN E. PROTACIO PROF. DOMINICA M. DACERA (Absent)
Member Vice Chair

ROF. CLETO L. NANOLA JR.
Chair

A Wk
B

RE ANNI E. MURAO
Chancellor |



