UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES MINDANAO
Bids and Awards Committee for Goods

BAC Resolution No. 25s. of 2023

DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BIDS (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING AWARD OF THE CONTRACTS FOR LOTS 1 — 4 OF THE SUPPLY OF
EQUIPMENT FOR THE INFECTIOUS DISEASES LABORATORY (PBM 2023-17)

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee for
Goods (BAC), posted on the PhilGEPS website, on the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place
within the campus for at least seven (7) calendar days, the Invitation to Bid of the Supply of Equipment for the
Infectious Diseases Laboratory (PBM 2023-17) consisting of four (4) lots with total approved budget for the contract
(ABC) in the amount of P8,700,000.00,

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings three (3) bidders purchased bid documents and submitted their bids
upon the deadline for submission on June 27, 2023, After the preliminary checking all the three bidders were
declared eligible for bidding;:

WHEREAS, upon opening and checking of the financial bids, the BAC read out the following bid amounts,
namely:

Lot Number - Description Approved Biosite Medical | Levin’s RainPhil Inc.
Budget for the | Instruments International
Contract Corporation
Lot 1- Cold Storage 3,000,000.00 No bid 2.758.000.00 2,840,000.00
Lot 2 - Centrifuge 1.800,000.00 No bid 1,690,000.00 1,487,000.00
Lot 3 — Biocontainment, 3,590,000.00 2,991,000.00 3,586,000.00 No bid
Sterilization and Small Equipment
Lot 4 — Liquid Handling System 310,000.00 No bid 248,800.00 288,500.00
TOTAL 8,700,000.00 2.991,000.00 8,282.800.00 4,615,500.00
¥

WHEREAS, for Lot 1 — Cold Storage, after the Technical Working Group (TWG) and end-user unit’s
representative conducted a thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by Levin’s
International Corporation, the lowest calculated bid (LCB), the said bidder was found to be non-compliant and
non-responsive to the technical specifications; whereas upon post qualification of the 2™ Jowest calculated bid,
RainPhil Inc. its bid was found to be compliant and responsive to the technical specifications;

WHEREAS, for Lot 2 — Centrifuge, the TWG reported that the bid submitted by RainPhil Inc., the lowest
calculated for this lot, was found to be compliant and responsive to the requirements;

WHEREAS, for Lot 3 — Biocontainment, Sterilization and Small Equipment, the Technical Working Group and
the end-user unit’s representative found the bid of Biosite Medical Instruments, the lowest calculated bid, to be non-
compliant to the specifications. The TWG and end-user then conducted the evaluation and post qualification on
the bid of the other bidder, Levin’s International Corporation which was found to be compliant and responsive
to the technical requirements;



WHEREAS, for Lot 4 — Liquid Handling System, after the Technical Working Group and the end-user unit’s
representative conducted a thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents submitted by the LCB
Levin’s International Corporation, it was found to be non-compliant to the specifications, while the next lowest
bidder, RainPhil Inc. was able to comply with the technical requirements for this lot;

NOW THEREFORE, we the members of the Bids and Awards Committee for Goods hereby RESOLVE as it
is hereby RESOLVED:

1) To declare the following bidders as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bids for the lots indicated

below:
Lot Number - Description Approved Lowest Calculated Bid Amount
Budget for the and Responsive
Contract Bid
Lot 1- Cold Storage 3,000,000.00 RainPhil Inc. 2.840,000.00
Lot 2 - Centrifuge 1,800,000.00 | RainPhil Inc. 1.487,000.00
Lot 3 — Biocontainment, 3.590,000.00 Levin’s 3,586,000.00
Sterilization and Small Equipment International
Corporation
Lot 4 — Liquid Handling System ©310,000.00 RainPhil Inc. 288.500.00
TOTAL 8,700,000.00 8,201,500.00

2) To recommend the foregoing for approval by the Chancellor.

RESOLVED during the meetings held on August 10, 2023 and August 17, 2023 at the Gaisano Conference Room
and online via Zoom, Davao City, Philippines.

Ms. JO-AN A. GARCIA (absent) a/PROF. JON HEN . SANTILLAN
Member Member
H " é ¢
PROF. JOYCE G. CAYAMANDA a/PROF. ERWIN E. PROTACIO
er Vice Chair
Approved:

PROWM JR PR()I:K):RE ANNI E. MURAO
Chair Chancellor }



