

**BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID
AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT**

Resolution No. 31, s. of 2017

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), posted the Invitation to Bid for the bidding of the Supply and Installation of Partitions, Air Conditioning Units and Various Office Equipment with a total approved budget of Five Million Seventy Five Thousand and 84/100 Pesos only (P5,075,000.84) in the PhilGEPS website, in UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings four (4) bidders purchased bid documents but only three (3) bidders submitted their bids upon the deadline for submission on December 21, 2017;

WHEREAS, after the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements the three bidders were found to be eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial envelopes the bids were read as follows:

Lot No	Description	Approved Budget	PhilBlanc Company	Goldman Enterprises	Air Prosystem
1	Supply & Installation of Partitions	1,861,648.00	1,582,401.00	No bid	No bid
2	Office Furniture	173,352.84	147,350.00	No bid	No bid
3	Vacuum Cleaner	215,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
4	Water Dispenser	10,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
5	Projectors and Computers	550,000.00	No bid	506,700.00	No bid
6	Desktop Computers	196,000.00	No bid	170,050.00	No bid
7	Laptop, Branded Desktop Computer & Projector	282,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
8	Air Conditioning Units	50,000.00	No bid	No bid	34,095.00
9	Inverter Type & Split Type ACU	1,660,000.00	No bid	No bid	1,678,153.77
10	ACU, 3HP, Floor Mounted	37,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
11	Industrial/Evaporative Air Cooler	40,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
	TOTAL	5,075,000.84			

WHEREAS, after thorough evaluation and post qualification of the technical specifications and other documents submitted by PhilBlanc Company for Lots 1 and 2, its bid was found to be compliant;